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Visiting Artist, printmakingRachel Duckhouse
Same River Twice
Glasgow based artist Rachel Duckhouse 
shares her drawing and printmaking  
practice, and some of the artist residencies 
that underpin it. Including a year with the 
Bow River in Calgary, trying to understand 
solar physicians in Paris, and gathering 
sheep in the Outer Hebrides. 

Rachel Duckhouse is a Glasgow based  
artist working primarily in pen and ink 
drawing and etching. Through drawing she 
explores structures, rhythms and patterns 
found in different contexts including land-
scape, architecture and the flow of water. 
Her work is often made in response to 
artist residencies, where she explores new 
landscapes or environments. She’s under-
taken artist residencies in Canada, Austra-
lia, France and Cornwall and has worked 
on public art commissions including the 
entrance gates of Edinburgh Printmakers. 
Her work has been acquired by The British 
Museum, Great Ormond Street Hospital in 
London and The Albert Einstein College of 
Medicine, New York.
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